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From: Zhao, Ying (STP)

Sent: 01/24/2012 10:41:19 AM

To: Kieran, Damian; Smith, Charles

CC: du Halgouet, Tanguy

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China -

Export Options

hi, Damian:

| checked with the forwarder you recommended, they can't do it either.

Only option now is to get this material waived, contact the attorney and find a way to get this material out
in a legal/formal way.

| have sent email out asking for the contact info but | have not received any answer yet. If you could, pls
let me know how to contact the attorney and | will follow up.

Thanks and Regards,
Michael Zhao

From: Kieran, Damian

Sent: Tuesday, January 24, 2012 7:39 AM

To: Zhao, Ying (STP); Smith, Charles

Cc: du Halgouet, Tanguy

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

Hi Michael,
Can you provide status on getting this resin moved out of China? Anything we can do to help?

Thanks,
Damian

From: Zhao, Ying (STP)

Sent: Tuesday, January 03, 2012 11:22 AM

To: Smith, Charles; Kieran, Damian

Cc: du Halgouet, Tanguy

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

| remember it is about $500 per month, something like that. We will pay through a PO, the way we
purchased the material. BSC China pays first, then cross charge to you.

| will confirm the details with distributor once | get back to China in mid of Jan. | am on vacation these 2
weeks.

Regards,
Michael

From: Smith, Charles

Sent: Tuesday, January 03, 2012 10:09 AM

To: Zhao, Ying (STP); Kieran, Damian

Cc: du Halgouet, Tanguy

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

Mike, what is charge and how are we paying?
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| would like to get this formalized as it make take a while to have material moved.
Thks
Charlie

From: Zhao, Ying (STP)

Sent: Tuesday, January 03, 2012 11:05 AM

To: Kieran, Damian

Cc: Smith, Charles

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

hi, Damian:

yes, it is in a safe storage now, the distributor moved the 15 tons into this place last month since it is
safer, better controlled and it could be a long term storage. Yes, we are being charged for this storage.

pls let me know how to contact the lawyer, need to find out how to go through the official way, get it
legalized.

Regards,
Michael

From: Kieran, Damian

Sent: Tuesday, January 03, 2012 7:46 AM

To: Zhao, Ying (STP)

Cc: Smith, Charles

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

Hi Michael,

We have just discussed this in Charlie’s weekly meeting — do you have any update on getting this
moved? Are we OK with current storage location until we get resin moved? Are we being charged for
storage?

Thanks,
Damian

From: Zhao, Ying (STP)

Sent: Friday, December 16, 2011 7:00 AM

To: Vialle, George; Smith, Charles; McCaslin, Todd; thierry (thierry.beyltiens@luxilon.be)
Cc: Kieran, Damian

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

Hi, guys:

K+N just told me that they can’t provide this service, they can’t make sure a smooth transportation thru
the custom without being inspected either.

We now have to look at the initial proposal to discuss with the lawyer, pay extra tax if needed and
transport it formally.

Pls let me know the contact info of the lawyer and | will follow up.

Best Regards,

Michael Zhao

Supplier Management Asia
Cardiac Rhythm Management
Boston Scientific Corp.
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Email: ying.zhao@bsci.com<mailto:ying.zhao@bsci.com>
Office: 86-21-61419708

Cell:

Unit 4701, Raffles City,

No. 268 Xizang Middle Road,

Shanghai, China 200001

From: Vialle, George

Sent: Friday, December 16, 2011 1:00 AM

To: Zhao, Ying (STP); Smith, Charles; McCaslin, Todd; thierry
(thierry.beyltiens@luxilon.be<mailto:thierry.beyltiens@luxilon.be>)
Cc: Kieran, Damian

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

Mike,
The address is:

Stephen Gould Corp
3927 Kraft Parkway

Ft Wayne, IN 46808
(260) 471-2228 (ext. 100)
(260) 471-2229 (fax)

Please provide an estimated shipment and delivery date when you have them. Also, can we select the
size of the pallets the product will be shipped on? How many pallets will be shipping to Indiana?

Thanks,
George

From: Zhao, Ying (STP)

Sent: Tuesday, December 13, 2011 10:44 AM

To: Smith, Charles; Vialle, George; McCaslin, Todd; thierry
(thierry.beyltiens@luxilon.be<mailto:thierry.beyltiens@luxilon.be>)
Cc: Kieran, Damian

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

Thanks, Charlie.
George, do you have the address for Indiana?

Best Regards,

Michael Zhao

Supplier Management Asia
Cardiac Rhythm Management
Boston Scientific Corp.

Email: ying.zhao@bsci.com<mailto:ying.zhao@bsci.com>
Office: 86-21-61419708
of\[QRedacted |

Unit 4701, Raffles City,

No. 268 Xizang Middle Road,
Shanghai, China 200001

From: Smith, Charles
Sent: Monday, December 12, 2011 9:15 PM
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To: Zhao, Ying (STP); Vialle, George; McCaslin, Todd; thierry
(thierry.beyltiens@luxilon.be<mailto:thierry.beyltiens@luxilon.be>)
Cc: Kieran, Damian

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

Mike
Here is info for Belgium:

LUXILON Industries NV
Industriepark / Vosveld 11
B-2110 Antwerp, Belgium

Our contact there is Thierry who can work with you/George on details for shipping.
I do not have for Indiana, George will provide
thks

Charlie

From: Zhao, Ying (STP)

Sent: Friday, December 09, 2011 11:18 AM

To: Vialle, George; Charest, Ann; McCaslin, Todd; Smith, Charles; Hines, Saron
Cc: Franklin, Irina; Kieran, Damian; Grato, Charles

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

Hi, guys:

Can | get the detailed delivery address for both Belgium and Indianapolis? The forwarder needs that for
shipment quote.
Thanks,

Best Regards,

Michael Zhao

Supplier Management Asia
Cardiac Rhythm Management
Boston Scientific Corp.

Email: ying.zhao@bsci.com<mailto:ying.zhao@bsci.com>
Office: 86-21-61419708

Cell: R
Unit 4701, Raffles City,

No. 268 Xizang Middle Road,
Shanghai, China 200001

From: Vialle, George

Sent: Friday, December 09, 2011 2:28 AM

To: Charest, Ann; Zhao, Ying (STP); McCaslin, Todd; Smith, Charles; Hines, Saron
Cc: Franklin, Irina; Kieran, Damian; Grato, Charles

Subject: Re: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

Ann,

We are still checking with legal and additional Freight Forwarders. We hope to resolve soon but are
moving cautiously to do it right.
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George

From: Charest, Ann

Sent: Thursday, December 08, 2011 12:23 PM

To: Vialle, George; Zhao, Ying (STP); McCaslin, Todd; Smith, Charles; Hines, Saron

Cc: Franklin, Irina; Kieran, Damian; Grato, Charles

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

Michael/George-

Any updates?

| just went through the photo’s again and based upon our due diligence, here in the states and in China, |
believe this is the right material. It may have not been imported through proper channels or redistributed
enough times, the original paperwork has been lost/forgotten along the way, but | think the agreed to
approach on offering to pay the import tax to be able to export it was sound.

Just curious as to where we are.

Ann

Ann Charest-Engfer

Manager, Global Sourcing, Resin

Boston Scientific, Inc.

4100 Hamline Avenue North

St. Paul, MN 55112-5798
Office: 651-582-5788

olIMR edacted

“Defining tomorrow, today.”

All information herin is CONFIDENTIAL and PROPRIETARY to Boston Scientific Corporation and may
not be disclosed without permission from BSC.

From: Vialle, George

Sent: Thursday, December 01, 2011 3:48 PM

To: Zhao, Ying (STP); McCaslin, Todd; Smith, Charles; Hines, Saron; Charest, Ann
Cc: Franklin, Irina; Kieran, Damian; Grato, Charles

Subject: RE: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

Attached is the shipment paperwork for the first 2000 Kilo’s as well as pictures of the resin in the original
and over bags.
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<< File: BSC_2_tons_shipping_info.pdf >> << File: DSC00253.jpg >> << File: 08142011146.jpg >> <<
File: 08142011145.jpg >> << File: 08142011144.jpg >> << File: 08142011143.jpg >> << File:
08142011147 .jpg >>

From: Vialle, George

Sent: Tuesday, November 29, 2011 11:17 AM

To: Vialle, George; Zhao, Ying (STP); McCaslin, Todd; Smith, Charles; Hines, Saron; Charest, Ann
Cc: Franklin, Irina; Kieran, Damian; Grato, Charles

Subject: Shipment of Marlex Resin from China - Export Options

When: Thursday, December 01, 2011 9:00 PM-9:30 PM (GMT-05:00) Eastern Time (US & Canada).
Where: ATT Con Call 877-663-6338 P-code 850140

All,

The purpose of this call is to discuss options to export the Marlex resin from China to Belgium and the
US. If there are any others who need to be involved please forward this request to them.

Regards,

George
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